
Level 2 Lesson 8 
 

HINDRANCES TO HEALING 
By Andrew Wommack 

 
 In our previous lesson, I talked about the fact that it is God’s will to heal, and that 
healing is part of the atonement. Much more could be said, because even if you accept it 
and have seen it in the Scriptures, it still raises a lot of questions such as, “If it’s God’s 
will to heal us, why isn’t everyone healed?” There are many reasons, and I’m just 
scratching the surface on the things I know. There is a lot of information that I simply am 
not able to get into here, but if it’s God’s will to heal, I want to address part of why 
people are not healed. One of the reasons is ignorance. You cannot operate in something 
you don’t know or understand, and in my own life that certainly was true. 
 
 I was trained to believe God’s will automatically came to pass, that I had no 
authority, power, or say-so in it. So through my ignorance, a number of things happened. 
My dad died when I was twelve-years old and two or three people had died in my 
presence by the time I was twenty-one. I was praying for all of them to be healed, but I 
didn’t see healing manifest, not because it wasn’t God’s will, but because of ignorance on 
my part. Ignorance is a reason why things happen, but it’s not an excuse. It’s like the law 
of gravity: a person could say, “Well, I didn’t realize that if I walked off a ten-story 
building it was going to kill me.” You don’t have to realize it to have the full impact of 
that law to work against you. People are ignorant about some of God’s laws. They don’t 
know how His healing system works, so ignorance is killing a lot of people. 
 
 Another thing that can hinder us from receiving healing is sin. It really upsets 
people when you say that, because they interpret what you are saying as all sickness is a 
result of some sin on our part, which is not true. That’s not what I’m saying. In John 9, 
there was an instance where Jesus was coming out of the temple, and His disciples 
pointed out a man there who was born blind. His disciples said in verse 2, “Master, who 
did sin, this man, or his parents, that he was born blind?” In other words, they were 
trying to relate his sickness directly to sin, asking if it his sin or t his parents’ sin that 
caused this sickness to come on him. Jesus’ answer was that neither of them had sinned. 
That’s not saying that the parents nor the son had ever sinned but that it wasn’t their sin 
that directly caused his blindness. It’s untrue to say that all sickness is related to sin, but 
it’s also untrue to say that sin is not one of the factors. 
 
 In John 5 there is an instance when Jesus was at the pool of Bethesda, and He 
healed a man supernaturally. There were multitudes in that place, and only one person 
was healed. Later the chapter shows that the man didn’t know who healed him when the 
Jews asked him in verse 12, “What man is that which said unto thee, Take up thy bed, 
and walk?” Verses 13-14 continue, “And he that was healed wist [knew] not who it was: 
for Jesus had conveyed himself away, a multitude being in that place, Afterward Jesus 
findeth him in the temple, and said unto him, Behold, thou art made whole: sin no more, 
lest a worse thing come unto thee” (brackets mine). Jesus said right here that sin would 
cause something worse than his paralysis to come upon him. He tied the result of sickness 
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to sin. He also said in John 9 that it wasn’t because of anybody’s sin that the man was 
born blind. 
 
 Some things just happen naturally, but there are times when sickness, disease, or 
problems can be a direct result of sin. Even in such cases, it doesn’t mean God is the one 
who is doing these things to us. Take, for instance, a person who lives a homosexual 
lifestyle, which is a perversion of nature. The human body is not made to live that way. 
Sexually communicated diseases come from that lifestyle. God is not the author of these 
diseases—it’s just nature rebelling because it’s not set up to live that way. For instance, if 
you go out and eat the wrong food, your body will respond, and it’s not God doing it to 
you. There are natural laws, natural factors here. So it is true that sin can be one of the 
reasons people aren’t healed. 
 
 If there’s a known sin in your life and you are believing God for healing, you 
need to stop the sin, because through it, you are giving Satan a direct access that’s 
hindering you from receiving what God is doing in your life. Romans 6:16 says, “Know 
ye not, that to whom ye yield yourselves servants to obey, his servant ye are to whom ye 
obey; whether of sin unto death, or of obedience unto righteousness?” That’s not saying 
that Satan becomes master in the sense that you lose your salvation and go to hell, but it 
means that whether you are a Christian or not—if you’re out living in sin—you’re giving 
Satan an inroad into your life. John 10:10 says that the thief comes for no other purpose 
except to steal, to kill, and to destroy. But Jesus came to give you life. So you’ve got 
Jesus trying to bring His life and health into you, but you’ve also got Satan trying to 
make you sick. If through sin you’re yielding yourself to Satan, you are empowering him 
and giving him an opportunity in your life. You can pray and ask God for healing all you 
want to, but your actions are allowing the devil to come in and bring sickness. So, if you 
are living in sin, you need to stop it. 
 
 I need to add that you could become so introspective that you would say “Well, 
I’m always less than what I should be” and get to a place where even though you believe 
God can heal, you believe He won’t because you don’t deserve it. That certainly is wrong 
too. None of us are ever going to obtain healing from God because we deserve it. God’s 
never had anyone qualified working for Him yet, so you don’t need to associate God 
moving in your life only to your performance, your holiness. It needs to be based on what 
Jesus has done for you and your faith in Him. At the same time, you can’t ignore your 
actions and yield yourself to the devil without him hindering you. You’ll see healing 
work much easier, much better in your life if you repent and quit anything you’re doing 
that would give Satan an inroad into your life. 
 
 Another factor that concerns healing that some people don’t think much about is 
the negativity and unbelief of other people that can affect you. One of the classic 
examples of this is in Mark 6 where Jesus was in His hometown, and the people didn’t 
respect Him because they remembered Him as a little boy. They knew His father and 
mother, brothers and sisters, and didn’t respect Him the way some people did. They came 
against him and criticized Him. Mark 6:4-6 says, “A prophet is not without honour, but in 
his own country, and among his own kin, and in his own house. And he could there do no 
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mighty work, save that he laid his hands upon a few sick folk, and healed them. And he 
marvelled because of their unbelief.” This doesn’t say that Jesus wouldn’t do any mighty 
works, but that He couldn’t. Here is Jesus, the Son of God, who came to earth as a man, 
who had no lack in His faith. And there certainly wasn’t any inroad of sin in His life. Yet 
He was limited to what He could do for other people because of their unbelief. Put this 
together with Matthew 13:58, where it says “And he did not many mighty works there 
because of their unbelief,” and we see that Jesus, who had no limitations in Himself and 
certainly no sin in His life to give Satan an inroad, was limited in what He could do 
because of the people around Him. 
 
 This is really important to understand that I’m saying it is God’s will to heal 
everyone all of the time. If you believe that, you might possibly make the mistake of 
going to a hospital and trying to empty it of every sick person because you believe it’s 
God’s will for them to be healed. It is God’s will for them to be healed, but He will not 
move against their own will. God will protect their right to be sick, their right not to be 
healed. No one can force them to be healed—and they can’t get healed off of someone 
else’s faith. Someone’s faith can help them if their struggling, but no one can do it for 
them. You can push a car when it’s in neutral, but you can’t push a car in park or reverse. 
If a person is set against healing, you cannot overcome it. Because of this, you can’t 
empty a hospital or go into a church service and see every person healed without their 
cooperation. 
 
 There’s so much more that could be said about this. When Jesus healed people, 
even raising the dead, He would go up to someone and say, “Weep not.” He would tell a 
mother not to weep and then raise her son from the dead. Somebody’s faith has to be used 
somewhere. There needs to be faith on our part, and there are so many, many other things 
involved in healing. I’ve discussed just a few here today, and hopefully they will help 
you, but one of the main things you need to get out of this is that God is faithful. It is His 
will for you to be healed, but you have to learn how to cooperate with Him. He can’t do it 
for you; He has to do it through you. It will come from the inside of you. 
 
 I pray that these things will help you to start yielding yourself, to allow the power 
of God to flow through you, and to walk in His supernatural health. 
 

Discipleship Questions 
 
1.  Read Matthew 8:17. What did Jesus do to obtain healing for us? 
________________________________________________________________________ 
 
2.  Read Hosea 4:6. Some people are not healed because of: A. ignorance (lack of 
knowledge).  B. they don’t go to church.  C. they are not good enough. 
 
3.  Read John 9:1-3. What did the disciples think caused this man’s blindness? 
______________________ Was their thinking correct? ___________________________ 
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4.  Read John 5:14. Sin does open the door for sickness, but not always. Besides sickness, 
what else could sin produce in an individual? 
________________________________________________________________________ 
 
5.  Read Romans 5:12-14 (in The Living Bible if possible). If sin is not always the cause 
of sickness, what could be another possible cause? _______________________________ 
 
6.  Read Acts 10:38. According to Acts 10:38, sickness can be caused by? 
________________________________________________________________________ 
 
7.  Read Matthew 13:58. Healing can be hindered by? ____________________________ 
 
8.  Read James 5:15. What will save the sick? __________________________________ 
 

Scriptures to Use with Questions 
 
Matthew 8:17 – “That it might be fulfilled which was spoken by Esaias the prophet, 
saying, Himself took our infirmities, and bare our sicknesses.” 
 
Hosea 4:6 – “My people are destroyed for lack of knowledge: because thou hast rejected 
knowledge, I will also reject thee, that thou shalt be no priest to me: seeing thou hast 
forgotten the law of thy God, I will also forget thy children.” 
 
John 9:1-3 – “And as Jesus passed by, he saw a man which was blind from his birth. And 
his disciples asked him, saying, Master, who did sin, this man, or his parents, that he was 
born blind? Jesus answered, Neither hath this man sinned, nor his parents: but that the 
works of God should be made manifest in him.” 
 
John 5:14 – “Afterward Jesus findeth him in the temple, and said unto him, Behold, thou 
art made whole: sin no more, lest a worse thing come unto thee.” 
 
Romans 5:12-14 (The Living Bible) – “[12] When Adam sinned, sin entered the entire 
human race. His sin spread death throughout all the world, so everything began to grow 
old and die, for all sinned. [13] We know that it was Adam’s sin that caused this because 
although, of course, people were sinning from the time of Adam until Moses, God did not 
in those days judge them guilty of death for breaking his laws—because he had not yet 
given his laws to them nor told them what he wanted them to do. [14] So when their 
bodies died it was not for their own sins since they themselves had never disobeyed God’s 
special law against eating the forbidden fruit, as Adam had. What a contrast between 
Adam and Christ who was yet to come!” 
 
Acts 10:38 – “How God anointed Jesus of Nazareth with the Holy Ghost and with power: 
who went about doing good, and healing all that were oppressed of the devil; for God 
was with him.” 
 
Matthew 13:58 – “And he did not many mighty works there because of their unbelief.” 
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James 5:15 – “And the prayer of faith shall save the sick, and the Lord shall raise him 
up; and if he have committed sins, they shall be forgiven him.” 
 

Answer Key 
 
1.  Read Matthew 8:17. What did Jesus do to obtain healing for us? He took our 
infirmities and carried away our diseases. 
 
2.  Read Hosea 4:6. Some people are not healed because of: A. ignorance (lack of 
knowledge). 
 
3.  Read John 9:1-3. What did the disciples think caused this man’s blindness? Sin. Was 
their thinking correct? No. 
 
4.  Read John 5:14. Sin does open the door for sickness, but not always. Besides sickness, 
what else could sin produce in an individual? Many things worse than sickness, even 
death (Rom. 6:23). 
 
5.  Read Romans 5:12-14 (in The Living Bible if possible). If sin is not always the cause 
of sickness, what could be another possible cause? The fall (Gen. 3). Adam through his 
transgression introduced sin and sickness into the human race. 
 
6.  Read Acts 10:38. According to Acts 10:38, sickness can be caused by? Being 
oppressed of the devil. 
 
7.  Read Matthew 13:58. Healing can be hindered by? Unbelief. 
 
8.  Read James 5:15. What will save the sick? The prayer of faith. 
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